
 
Thirteenth Parliament                        Third Session 

Afternoon Sitting 

                     
(No. 108)                    (3197) 
 

 

 

REPUBLIC OF KENYA 
 

THIRTEENTH PARLIAMENT – (THIRD SESSION) 
 

THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY 
 

ORDERS OF THE DAY 
 

 

 

TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024 AT 2.30 P.M. 

 

ORDER OF BUSINESS 
 

PRAYERS 
 

1. Administration of Oath 

2. Communication from the Chair 

3. Messages 

4. Petitions 

5. Papers 

6. Notices of Motion  

7. Questions and Statements 
 

8*. PROCEDURAL MOTION- RESOLUTION TO SIT UNTIL 
CONCLUSION OF SPECIFIED 
BUSINESS 
(The Leader of the Majority Party) 

 

THAT, pursuant to Standing Order 30(3)(a), this House orders that, 
should the time appointed for adjournment of the House be reached before 
conclusion of business listed as Order No. 13 (Committee of the Whole House) in today’s 
Order Paper, the sitting shall stand extended until conclusion of the said business. 

 

9*. MOTION – DEBATE ON THE PRESIDENT’S ADDRESS (DAY 4) 
(The Leader of the Majority Party) 
 

THAT, pursuant to the provisions of Standing Order 24(6), the thanks of 
this House be recorded for the exposition of public policy contained in the Address 
of H.E. the President delivered in Parliament on Thursday, 21st November 2024 and 
further, that this House notes the following Reports submitted by H.E. the President 
in fulfillment of the provisions of Articles 132(1)(c) and 240(7) of the Constitution, 
laid on the Table of the House on Monday, 25th November 2024- 

 

…...……/9*(Cont’d) 



(No. 108)                 TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                    (3198) 

(i) The 11th Annual Report on the Measures Taken and Progress Achieved in 
the Realization of National Values and Principles of Governance;                                             

(ii) The 11th Annual Report on the Progress made in Fulfilling the International 
Obligations of the Republic of Kenya; and, 

(iii) The Annual Report to Parliament on the State of National Security. 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Morning Sitting) 

 

10*. SPECIAL MOTION – APPOINTMENT OF A MEMBER OF 
PARLIAMENT TO THE PARLIAMENTARY 
SERVICE COMMISSION  
(The Leader of the Majority Party) 
 

THAT, pursuant to the provisions of Article 127(2)(c)(i) of the 
Constitution, this House approves the appointment of Sen. Wahome 
Wamatinga, MP to the Parliamentary Service Commission to fill the vacancy 
occasioned by the resignation of Sen. John Nderitu Kinyua, MP. 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Morning Sitting) 

11*. THE KENYA REVENUE AUTHORITY (AMENDMENT) (No. 2) BILL 
(NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 35 OF 2024) 

(The Leader of the Majority Party) 
 

Second Reading 
 

 (Resumption of debate interrupted on Wednesday, November 20, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 
12*. MOTION-  CONSIDERATION OF MEDIATED VERSION OF THE 

DIVISION OF REVENUE (AMENDMENT) BILL 
(NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 38 OF 2024) 
(The Chairperson, Mediation Committee on the Division of 
Revenue (Amendment) Bill, 2024) 
 

THAT, pursuant to the provisions of Article 113(2) of the Constitution 
and Standing Order 150(3), this House adopts the Report of the Mediation 
Committee on the Division of Revenue (Amendment) Bill (National Assembly Bill 
No. 38 of 2024), laid on the table of the House on Monday, 25th November 2024, and 
approves the Mediated version of the Division of Revenue (Amendment) Bill 
(National Assembly Bill No. 38 of 2024). 

(The Mediated version of the Bill is published in the Notices) 

 

13*. COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE HOUSE 
 

The Coffee Bill (Senate Bill No. 10 of 2023) 
(The Leader of the Majority Party – Co-Sponsor) 
 

 (If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Morning Sitting) 

…...……/14* 



(No. 108)               TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                    (3199) 
 

14*. THE UNCLAIMED FINANCIAL ASSETS (AMENDMENT) BILL 
(NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 15 OF 2024) 

  (The Leader of the Majority Party) 
 

Second Reading 
 

15*. THE PUBLIC FINANCE MANAGEMENT (AMENDMENT) (No. 3) 
BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 44 OF 2024) 

  (The Leader of the Majority Party) 
 

     Second Reading 
 

16*. THE PUBLIC FINANCE MANAGEMENT (AMENDMENT) (No. 4) 
BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 45 OF 2024) 

  (The Leader of the Majority Party) 
 

            Second Reading 
 

17*. THE PUBLIC PROCUREMENT AND ASSET DISPOSAL 
(AMENDMENT) BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 48 OF 2024) 

  (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Finance and National Planning) 
 

           Second Reading 

18*. THE LAND CONTROL BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 39 
OF 2023) 
(The Hon. (Dr.) Wilberforce Oundo, M.P.)  

Second Reading 
 

(Resumption of debate interrupted on Wednesday, November 6, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

(Balance of time – 1 hour 26 minutes) 
 

19*. THE HIGHER EDUCATION LOANS BOARD (AMENDMENT) BILL 
(NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 58 OF 2022) 
(The Hon. Joyce Kamene, M.P.) 

Second Reading 
 

(Resumption of debate interrupted on Friday, October 18, 2024 – Morning Sitting) 

(Balance of time – 3 hours 21 minutes) 

 

20*. MOTION – CONSIDERATION OF REPORTS ON FINANCIAL 
STATEMENTS OF STATE CORPORATIONS (NYANZA     
REGION) 

  (The Chairperson, Public Investments Committee on Governance      
and Education) 

 

THAT, this House adopts the Report of the Public Investments 
Committee on Governance and Education on its Examination of the Reports of  

…...……/20*(Cont’d) 



(No. 108)               TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                    (3200) 

the Auditor-General on the Financial Statements of State Corporations (Nyanza 
Region) for the financial year 2018/2019, 2019/2020 and 2020/2021, laid on the 
Table of the House on Thursday, 25th July 2024 subject to— 

(a) deletion of paragraph 212 appearing on page 41 of the report and 

substituting therefor the following new paragraph – 

“The Committee recommends that the irregular cash payments 

made for the casual works done amounting to Kshs. 2,308,996 be 

surcharged to the Governing Council of Kisumu National 

Polytechnic. The amount is to be paid within six months after the 

adoption of this report by the House; 

(b) deletion of paragraph 216 appearing on page 41 of the report and 

substituting therefor the following new paragraph – 

“The Committee recommends that the long outstanding imprest 

of Kshs. 37,800 be written off from the institution’s books of 

accounts since no money was lost; it was as a result of demise of 

the employee”; and, 

(c) effecting the consequential amendments in the report." 

(Resumption of debate interrupted on Wednesday, November 6, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 

 

 

21*. THE POLITICAL PARTIES (AMENDMENT) BILL (NATIONAL 
ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 35 OF 2022) 
(The Vice Chairperson, Procedure and House Rules Committee) 

 

Second Reading 
 

22*. THE PUBLIC FINANCE MANAGEMENT (AMENDMENT) BILL 
(NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 38 OF 2022) 
(The Vice Chairperson, Procedure and House Rules Committee) 
 

Second Reading 
 
 

23*. THE EQUALISATION FUND (ADMINISTRATION) BILL (SENATE 
BILL NO. 14 OF 2023) 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Finance and National Planning) 
 

Second Reading 
 

 

 

 

…...……/24* 



(No. 108)               TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                    (3201) 

24*. MOTION – ALLEGED UNFAIR TRADE PRACTICES BY FOREIGN 
INVESTORS IN KENYA 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Trade, Industry 
and Cooperatives) 
 

THAT, this House adopts the Report of the Departmental Committee 
on Trade, Industry and Cooperatives on the Inquiry into Alleged Unfair Trade 
Practices by Foreign Investors in Kenya, laid on the Table of the House on Thursday, 
7th March 2024. 

25*. MOTION – THIRD REPORT ON CONSIDERATION OF THE 
AUDITED ACCOUNTS OF SPECIFIED STATE 
CORPORATIONS 
(The Chairperson, Public Investments Committee on Social 
Services, Administration and Agriculture) 

THAT, this House adopts the Third Report of the Public Investments 
Committee on Social Services, Administration and Agriculture on its consideration 
of the Report of the Auditor-General on the Financial Statements of the following 
State Corporations, laid on the Table of the House on Tuesday, 30th July 2024— 

(i) Kenyatta National Hospital, FY 2018/2019 and 2019/2020; 

(ii) Kenya Medical Supplies Authority, FY 2017/2018 and 2018/2019; 

(iii) Kenya Veterinary Board, FY 2018/2019, 2019/2022 and 2020/2021; 

(iv) National Authority for the Campaign against Alcohol and Drug Abuse, FY 
2017/2018, 2018/2019, 2019/2020 and 2020/2021; and 

(v) Kenya Broadcasting Corporation, FY 2000/2001, 2001/2002, 2002/2003, 
2003/2004, 2004/2005, 2005/2006, 2006/2007, 2007/2008, 2008/2009, 
2009/2010, 2010/2011, 2011/2012 and 2012/2013. 

 

26*. THE UNIVERSITIES (AMENDMENT) BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY 
BILL NO. 38 OF 2023) 

(The Chairperson, Public Investments Committee on Governance and Education) 

Second Reading 
 

27*. MOTION – REPORT OF THE EXTRAORDINARY SESSION OF 
THE SIXTH PAN-AFRICAN PARLIAMENT (PAP) 
(Member of the Pan-African Parliament) 

 
THAT, this House notes the Report of the Kenya Delegation to the 

Extraordinary Session of the Sixth Parliament of the Pan-African Parliament, held 
in Midrand, South Africa, from 20th to 27th March 2024, laid on the Table of the House 
on Thursday, 2nd May 2024. 

…...……/28* 



(No. 108)               TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                    (3202) 

28*. MOTION – REPORT ON THE PERFORMANCE AUDIT REPORT 
ON THE PROVISION OF SERVICES TO PERSONS 
WITH DISABILITIES BY THE NATIONAL COUNCIL 
FOR PERSONS WITH DISABILITIES 
(The Chairperson, Public Investments Committee on Social 
Services, Administration and Agriculture) 
 

THAT, this House adopts the Report of the Public Investments 
Committee on Social Services, Administration and Agriculture on its consideration 
of the Performance Audit Report by the Auditor-General on the Provision of 
Services to Persons with Disabilities by the National Council for Persons with 
Disabilities, laid on the Table of the House on Tuesday, 30th July 2024. 

 
29*. THE NATIONAL POLICE SERVICE COMMISSION (AMENDMENT) 

BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 23 OF 2024) 

(The Hon. Peter Masara, M.P.) 

Second Reading 
 

 

 

 

         *Denotes Orders of the Day* 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

…......./Notices* 



(No. 108)            TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3203) 

N O T I C E S 

 

I. MEDIATED VERSION OF THE DIVISION OF REVENUE 

(AMENDMENT) BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL 

NO. 38 OF 2024) 

 

THE DIVISION OF REVENUE (AMENDMENT) 
BILL, 2024 

A Bill for 

AN ACT of Parliament to amend the Division of Revenue Act 
 

ENACTED by Parliament of Kenya, as follows— 

1. This Act may be cited as the Division of  Revenue (Amendment) 
Act, 2024. 

Short title.  
  

2. The Division of  Revenue Act, 2024 is amended by deleting the 
Schedule and substituting therefor the following new Schedule — 

Deletion and 
replacement of  the 
Schedule to No.5 of  
2024.  

 

                                      SCHEDULE                         (s.2)  

 

ALLOCATION OF REVENUE RAISED NATIONALLY BETWEEN THE 

NATIONAL GOVERNMENT AND COUNTY GOVERNMENTS FOR THE 

2024/25 FINANCIAL YEAR 

Type/level of allocation Amount in Kshs. 

Percentage (%) of 
2020/21 audited and 
approved Revenue 
i.e. Kshs. 
1,570,562,945,014 

A.    Total Sharable 
Revenue   

2,631,418,000,000   

B.    National Government   2,235,993,000,000   

C.     Equalization Fund         8,000,000,000   

    of which:  a). 0.5 Per 
Centum  

       7,852,814,725 0.50% 

                     b). Arrears            147,185,275   

D.    County Equitable 
Share  

   387,425,000,000 24.67% 

 

 

........../Notices*(Cont’d) 



(No. 108)            TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3204) 

 

II. THE COFFEE BILL (SENATE BILL NO. 10 OF 

2023) 
 

1) Notice is given that the Chairperson of the Departmental Committee on 
Agriculture and Livestock intends to move the following amendments to the 
Coffee Bill, 2023 at the Committee Stage— 

CLAUSE 2 

THAT, Clause 2 of the Bill be amended by— 

(a)  deleting the definition of “broker” and substituting therefor the following new 
definition— 

“broker” means a person cleared by the exchange and licensed by 
the Capital Markets Authority, appointed by a grower or an 
association of growers in accordance with the Capital Markets Act, 
to offer their coffee on their behalf through the Exchange”;   

 
 
Cap 485A 

(b) deleting the definition of “clearing and settlement”. 

(c) deleting the definition of “coffee grower” and substituting therefor the 
following new definition— 

“coffee grower” means a person who cultivates coffee in Kenya, and may 
for purposes of licensing, include a co-operative society, coffee union, 
association and estate.” 

(d)  deleting the definition of “sales catalogue” and substituting therefor the 
following new definition— 

“sales catalogue” means a standard document prepared by a grower or a 
broker appointed by a grower, in consultation with an exchange, for sale 
of clean coffee at an exchange”; 

(e)  deleting the definition of “secondary processing” and substituting therefor the 
following new definition— 

 “secondary processing” means parchment and buni de-husking, polishing, 
grading and may include grinding, and packaging of clean coffee beans”; 

(f) deleting the definition of “small holder” and substituting therefor the following 
new definition— 

“small holder” means a person cultivating coffee in a small parcel of land 
or in small parcels of land who does not own a pulping station.” 

(g) inserting the following new definitions in their proper alphabetical sequence— 
 “Authority” means Capital Markets Authority established under the 

Capital Markets Act” (Cap.485); 
 
 



(No. 108)           TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3205) 

“miller” means a person who is involved in the process of de-husking 
and possible grading of coffee and includes grading of clean coffee”; and 

“roaster” means a person who is in the business or process of turning 
green coffee into usable coffee products”; 

 
CLAUSE 3 

THAT, Clause 3 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) by deleting paragraph (e), and substituting therefor the following new 
paragraph― 

“(e) promote integration of the value chain actors for purposes of 
achieving economies of scale;” 
 

(b) by deleting paragraph (f) and substituting therefor the following new 
paragraph— 
 “(f) promotion of coffee research and training for the development of the 

coffee sector;” 
 

(c) in paragraph (g), by deleting sub-paragraph (i) and substituting therefor the 
following new sub-paragraph— 

 “(i) the establishment and management of coffee development levy”; 

CLAUSE 6 

THAT, Clause 6 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1), by inserting the words “or bank accounts” immediately after 
the word “account” appearing in paragraph (e). 

 

(b) by deleting subclause (2) and substituting therefor the following new 
subclause— 

“(2) The Board may, if it considers necessary, enter into association with 
such bodies or organisations whose objects and purpose support the 
promotion of the coffee industry.” 

CLAUSE 7 

THAT, Clause 7 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1)― 
(i) by inserting the following new paragraph immediately after paragraph 

(d)— 
“(da) the Principal Secretary responsible for National Treasury or a 

designated representative;” 
 

(ii) by deleting paragraph (e) and substituting therefor the following new 
paragraph— 

“(e) two persons of the opposite gender, representing smallholder 
and large-scale coffee growers’ associations nominated by their 
umbrella body;” 

 
 



(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3206) 

(iii) by deleting paragraph (f) and substituting therefor the following new 

paragraph— 

“(f) one person nominated by coffee cooperative societies.” 
 

(iv) by deleting paragraph (g) and substituting therefor the following new 

paragraph— 

“(g) one person with knowledge of the coffee industry nominated by 

county governments;” 

(v) by inserting the following new paragraphs immediately after paragraph 

(g)— 

“(ga) one person representing coffee millers; 

   (gb) one person representing coffee traders;” 

(b) by deleting subclause (2) and substituting therefor the following new subclause— 

“(2) The Cabinet Secretary shall observe the principle of gender balance 

when appointing the members under subsection (1) (e), (f), (g), (ga) 

and (gb)”. 

 

CLAUSE 8 

THAT, Clause 8 of the Bill be amended by inserting the following new subclause 

immediately after subclause (1)— 

“(2) for purposes of this section, “coffee management” means the process of 

increasing coffee production per tree, including appropriate agroecology, 

determination of plant population, planting, crop husbandry, harvesting and 

conveying through pulping stations. 

 

CLAUSE 9 

THAT, Clause 9 of the Bill be amended by deleting the expression “7(1)(a), (c), (f), 

(g)” and substituting therefor the following new expression “7(1)(a), (e), (f), (g) (ga), 

(gb)”. 

 

CLAUSE 11 

THAT, Clause 11 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1)— 

(i) by deleting paragraph (e) and substituting therefor the following new 

paragraph— 

“(e) collect, collate and maintain a data base to ensure ease of access to 

information on the coffee industry;” 

 



(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3207) 

(ii) by deleting paragraph (f) and substituting therefor the following new 

paragraph— 

“(f) conduct national and international coffee market intelligence and 

surveys to facilitate market access and inform promotional and branding 

strategies including the application of the Kenya Coffee Mark of Origin;” 

 

(iii) by deleting paragraph (p) and substituting therefor the following new 
paragraph— 
“(p) source for and market Kenyan coffee internationally;” 

 
(iv) by inserting the following new paragraph immediately after paragraph 

(p)— 
“(pa) adopt marketing strategies that leverage digital platforms to reach 

broader audience and boost coffee sales;” 
 

(b) by deleting subclause (2) and substituting therefor the following new 
subclause— 

“(2) The Board shall, in the performance of its functions under this Act, 
consult and collaborate with the relevant licensing authority and other 
industry players”. 

 
CLAUSE 12 

THAT, Clause 12 of the Bill be amended by deleting subclause (2) and substituting 

therefor the following new subclauses— 

“(2) The Board of directors may co-opt persons whose knowledge and 
skills are necessary for resolution of any pertinent matter under consideration 
by the committee or the Board for performance of its function and exercise of 
its powers under this Act. 

(3) Notwithstanding subclause (2), the Board shall not co-opt more than 
five (5) persons at any particular time.” 

  
CLAUSE 14 

THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting Clause 14 and substituting therefor the 

following new clause— 

“14. The members of the Board of Directors shall be paid such 
remuneration as the Salaries and Remuneration Commission shall 
determine”. 

Remuneration of the 
board of directors. 

 
CLAUSE 15 

THAT, Clause 15 of the Bill be amended by deleting subclause (2) and substituting 
therefor the following new subclause— 

“(2) A person is qualified for appointment under subsection (1) if the person— 



(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3208) 

(a) holds a post graduate degree in agriculture, business, law or any other 
relevant field from a university recognized in Kenya;  

(b) has at least ten years’ knowledge and experience from a relevant field;  

(a) has at least five years’ experience in a senior management position; and 

(b) meets the requirements of Chapter Six of the Constitution”. 
 

CLAUSE 23 

THAT, Clause 23 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) by deleting subclause (2) and substituting therefor the following new 
subclause— 

“(2) A county government may impose levies and fees as may be 
necessary for the registration and issuance of licences in accordance with the 
respective county legislation and such standards as may be prescribed by the 
Cabinet Secretary under this Act.” 

 
(b) by deleting subclause (3) and substituting therefor the following new 

subclause— 
“(3) The Cabinet Secretary shall, in consultation with the Board and the 

respective county government, prescribe standards and guidelines for the 
setting of levies and fees by the county government under subsection (2).” 

 

CLAUSE 24 

THAT, Clause 24 of the Bill be amended by— 

(a) re-numbering the existing provision as subclause (1); and  

(b) inserting the following new subclause immediately after subclause (1)— 
“(2) The Cabinet Secretary shall, in consultation with the Board and 

county governments prescribe standards and guidelines to be adhered to 
while enacting specific county legislations.” 

 

CLAUSE 25 

THAT, Clause 25 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (2), deleting the words “county executive committee member” and 
substituting therefor the words “county government.” 
 

(b) by inserting the following new subclause immediately after subclause (3)— 
“(4)A county government shall maintain the necessary statistical 

information with respect to the coffee sector and avail such information 
to the Board where necessary for proper planning.” 

 
 

 



(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3209) 

CLAUSE 26 

THAT, Clause 26 of Bill be amended— 

(a) by deleting paragraph (a) and substituting therefor the following new 
paragraph— 

“(a) promoting production and productivity;” 
 

(b) by deleting subclause (2) and substituting therefor the following new 
subclause— 

“(2) A county government shall regularly share the necessary statistical 
information with respect to the coffee sector with the Board and such 
information shall form the basis for proper planning by the Board. 

 
CLAUSE 27 

THAT, Clause 27 of the Bill be amended in subclause (8) by inserting the word 

“annually” immediately after the expression “subsection (6)”. 

 
CLAUSE 28 

THAT, Clause 28 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (2), by deleting paragraph (a); 

(b) by deleting subclause 4; 

(c) by deleting subclause 5; 

(d) by deleting subclause 6; and 

(e) by deleting subclause 7 
 

CLAUSE 30 

THAT, Clause 30 of the Bill be amended by deleting subclause (2) and substituting 

therefor the following new subclause— 

Cap.485A 

 
“(2) A person shall not conduct the business of a coffee exchange, 

agent or offer brokerage services at the exchange unless that person is 
licensed by the Authority in accordance with the provisions of the 
Capital Markets Act”. 

 

CLAUSE 32 

THAT, Clause 32 of the Bill be amended by deleting the word “monthly” and 

substituting therefor the word “quarterly”. 

 
 

 



(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3210) 

CLAUSE 33 

THAT, Clause 33 of the Bill be amended in subclause (5), by deleting the words 

“county executive committee member” and substituting therefor the words “county 

government”.  

 

CLAUSE 37 

THAT, Clause 37 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1), by deleting the words “county executive committee member” 
and substituting therefor the words “county government”. 
 

(b) by deleting subclause (2) and substituting therefor the following new 
subclause— 

“(2) The Board shall submit to the respective county government a 
report on the registered and licensed dealers and other service providers 
within the respective county at the end of each month or within such 
timelines as may be agreed upon with the respective county government.” 

  
CLAUSE 38 

THAT, the Bill be amended― 

(a) by moving Part IX - COFFEE RESEARCH AND TRAINING INSTITUTE 
OF KENYA (Clauses 69 to 84) to appear immediately after Clause 38; and 

(b) by moving Part X-FINANCIAL PROVISIONS OF THE INSTITUTE 
(Clauses 85 to 91) to appear immediately after the following new Part VA - 
COFFEE RESEARCH AND TRAINING INSTITUTE OF KENYA. 

 
CLAUSE 39 

THAT, Clause 39 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) by deleting subclause (1); 
 

(b) in subclause (2), by deleting the words “county executive member” and 
substituting therefor the words “county government”. 

 
CLAUSE 40 

THAT, Clause 40 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) by inserting the words 

“and licensed” immediately after the words “been registered”  

CLAUSE 42 

THAT, Clause 42 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (3), by deleting the words “county executive committee member” 
and substituting therefor the words “county government”. 

 



(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3211) 

(b) in subclause (4), by deleting the words “county executive committee member” 
and substituting therefor the words “county government”. 

CLAUSE 43 

THAT, Clause 43 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (4), by deleting the words “county executive committee member” 
appearing in paragraph (b) and substituting therefor the words “county 
government”. 

(b) in subclause (5), by deleting the words “county executive committee member” 
and substituting therefor the words “county government”. 

 
CLAUSE 44 

THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting Clause 44 and substituting therefor the 

following new clause— 

“44. The processing of coffee shall be carried out at 
designated, standard approved facilities in accordance with 
established and approved Coffee Standards and Industry 
Code of Practice.” 

Requirements relating to 
coffee processing. 

 
CLAUSE 45 

THAT, Clause 45 of the Bill be amended in subclause (3) by deleting the words 

“comprehensive” appearing in paragraph (b). 

NEW CLAUSE 45A 

THAT, the Bill be amended by inserting the following new clause immediately after 

Clause 45― 

45A. (1) A coffee miller may bulk parchment or buni or coffee of the 
same quality and characteristics in order to attain millable quantities.  

(2) A coffee miller who bulks coffee shall avail information, in the 
prescribed form, to an exchange and the direct settlement system 
provider on the proportions of the bulked coffees for purposes of 
processing payments. 

Bulking 
of coffee. 

(3) The Board and the respective county government shall, separately 
or jointly undertake regular inspections to ensure compliance with this 
Act by the coffee millers. 

(4) A coffee grower may deliver coffee samples not exceeding five 
hundred grams of parchment or buni for independent quality analysis by 
a laboratory before delivery to a commercial coffee miller. 

(5) A laboratory to which a sample is submitted under subsection (4) 
shall issue to the coffee grower a report on quality compliance in the 
prescribed form. 

 



(No. 108)  TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                  (3212) 

(6) A coffee miller shall remit two hundred- and fifty-grams samples 
for each grade of an out-turn to the Board for quality analysis and 
assessment of conformity with coffee standards. 

(7) A co-operative society or association comprising smallholder 
growers that intends to obtain milling services shall competitively procure 
the services of a miller or other service providers to whom the coffee is 
intended to be delivered for milling. 

(8) Any charges imposed for the delivery of services to a coffee grower 
shall be communicated in the prescribed form to the direct settlement 
system provider before the sale of coffee for the purpose of settlement 
after the sale has been conducted. 

CLAUSE 47 

THAT, Clause 47 of the Bill be amended by deleting subclause (2). 

CLAUSE 48 

THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting Clause 48. 

CLAUSE 49 

THAT, Clause 49 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1), by deleting paragraph (d) 

and substituting therefor the following new paragraph— 

“(d) such other methods as the Cabinet Secretary in consultation with the 
relevant licensing authority may prescribe”. 

CLAUSE 53 

THAT, Clause 53 of the Bill be amended by deleting subclause (1) and substituting 

therefor the following new subclause— 

“(1) A grower or a broker appointed by a grower shall, in consultation with an 
exchange, prepare a sales catalogue for coffee destined for sale at exchange 
in a licensed warehouse in accordance with the Act”. 

 
CLAUSE 54 

THAT, Clause 54 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (2) by deleting the words “county executive committee member” 
and substituting therefor the words “county government”; and 
 

(b) in subclause (5) by deleting paragraph (a) and substituting therefor the following 
new paragraph— 

“(a) insure all coffee in the warehouse or under their custody against fire, 
theft and other insurable risks;”  

 
 



(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3213) 

CLAUSE 57 

THAT, Clause 57 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1), by inserting the words “of quality analysis” immediately after 
the word “certificate” appearing in paragraph (a); and 
 

(b) in subclause (3), by inserting the word “analysis” immediately after the words 
“certificate of quality” appearing in paragraph (b). 

 
CLAUSE 60 

THAT, the Bill be amended in Clause 60— 

(a) by deleting subclause (1) and substituting therefor the following new 
subclause— 

“(1) The Board, in collaboration with the respective licencing authority 
shall, enforce of coffee industry standards along the value chain for 
purposes of quality assurance.” 

(b) by deleting subclause (2) and substituting therefor the following new 
subclause— 

“(2) The Board, in consultation with the Kenya 
Institute of Curriculum Development established 
under the Kenya Institute of Curriculum 
Development Act and accredited universities may 
develop a training curriculum, conduct examinations 
and jointly issue certificates for coffee liquorers. 

 
Cap 211A 

(c) by deleting subclause (5) and substituting therefor the following new 
subclause— 

“(5) The Board shall, in collaboration with the respective county 
governments establish cupping centers in the counties for purposes 
of conducting coffee quality analysis and capacity building.” 

(d) by deleting subclause (7) and substituting therefore the following new 
subclause— 

“(7) The Board may sample coffee at any stage of the value chain 
to ascertain permissible maximum residual pesticide levels for 
compliance with set national and international standards”. 

(e) in subclause (8) by deleting the words “county executive committee member” 
and substituting therefor the words “county government”. 

(f) by deleting subclause (9) and substituting therefor the following new subclause 
“(9) The Board shall in collaboration with the licencing authorities 

and other relevant bodies conduct periodic surveillance on the 
application of pesticide to ensure compliance with set standards and 
best practices.” 

 



(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3214) 

CLAUSE 61 

THAT, Clause 61 of the Bill be amended in— 

(a) in subclause (1) by deleting the words “county executive committee member” 
and substituting therefor the words “county government”; and 

(b) in subclause (2) by deleting the words “county executive committee member” 
and substituting therefor the words “county government”. 

 
CLAUSE 64 

THAT, Clause 64 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) by deleting the marginal note and substituting therefor the following new 
marginal note— 

“Coffee development and marketing levy”; 
 

(b) in subclause (1) by deleting the words “two per centum” and substituting 
therefor the words “two and a half per centum”; 

 

(c) by deleting subclause (2) and substituting therefor the following new 
subclause— 
 

“(2) The levy imposed under subsection (1) shall be apportioned as follows— 
(a) thirty-five per centum to the Institute; 
(b) twenty per centum to the Board for regulatory purposes;  
(c) fifteen per centum to the Board for marketing purposes; and  
(d) ten per centum to the counties growing areas on pro-rata basis as a 

conditional grant for coffee development.” 
 

CLAUSE 67 

THAT, Clause 67 of the Bill be amended in subclause (3) by deleting the words “the 

National Assembly and Senate” and substituting therefor the word “Parliament”. 

 

CLAUSE 71 

THAT, the Bill be amended in Clause 71 subclause (1) by deleting the words “a bank 

account” and substituting therefor the words “bank accounts” in paragraph (c). 

 

CLAUSE 72 

THAT, Clause 72 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1)— 
(i) by deleting paragraph (d) and substituting therefore the following new 

paragraph— 
“(d) the Director General of Kenya Agricultural and Livestock 

Research Organization”  
 



 
(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3215) 

(ii) by deleting paragraph (g) and substituting therefor the following new 
paragraph— 

“(g) the chief executive officer of the Board appointed in accordance 
with section 15”; 

(iii) by inserting the following new paragraphs immediately after paragraph 
(g)— 

“(ga) one person representing the county governments; 
(gb) one person representing coffee traders nominated by the 

apex body representing coffee traders.” 

(b) in subclause (3) by deleting the word “three” and substituting therefor the 
word “five”. 

(c) by inserting the following new subclause immediately after subclause (3)— 
“(4) In making appointments under subsection (1), the appointing 

authority shall take into consideration the principle of gender 
balance.” 

 
CLAUSE 73 

THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting Clause 73 and substituting therefor the 

following new clause— 

Term of 
appointment. 

“73. The persons appointed under section 72 (1) (a), (e), (f), (g), 
(ga), (gb) and (h) shall serve for a term of four years renewable for 
one further term.” 

  
CLAUSE 74 

THAT, Clause 74 of the Bill be amended in paragraph (f) by deleting the word “his” 

and substituting therefor the word “the” 

 

CLAUSE 75 

THAT, the Bill be amended in Clause 75— 

(a) by deleting subclause (1) and substituting therefor the following new 
subclause— 

 
“(1) The Institute shall― 

(a) develop appropriate systems to promote balanced, 
diversified and sustainable coffee development and to 
optimise coffee production through adaptive and 
investigative research; 

(b) prioritise areas for, and co-ordinate, coffee research including 
research in coffee diseases and new coffee varieties; 

 



(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3216) 

(c) facilitate the use of improved production technology and 
establish adequate feedback systems from agricultural 
producers in order to achieve and maintain national self-
sufficiency and export capacities in agricultural products; 

(d) advise the National and county governments on the resource 
requirements for coffee research;  

(e) develop curriculum and offer training on research, 
innovations and technology; and 

(f) disseminate, in collaboration with the Board, the Kenya 
Agricultural and Livestock Research Organisation 
established under the Kenya Agricultural and Livestock 
Research Organisation Act and other organizations, 
knowledge, information and application of research findings 
in relation to coffee.” 

(b) in subclause (2)— 
(i) by deleting paragraph (c) and substituting therefor the following new 

paragraph— 
“(c) identify and disseminate, in collaboration with other relevant 

agencies, appropriate systems of mechanisation and 

technology options to improve coffee production and 

productivity and provide answers to foreseeable problems 

facing coffee;” 

(ii) by deleting paragraph (m) and substituting therefor the following new 
paragraph— 
 

“(m) provide a climate resilient coffee crop and coffee that is 
resistant to diseases and pests.” 

 
CLAUSE 76 

THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting Clause 76 and substituting therefor the 

following new clause— 

Power to co-
opt. 

76. The Council of the Institute may co-opt persons 
whose knowledge and skills are necessary for resolution of 
any pertinent matter under its consideration for performance 
of its function and exercise of its powers under this Act.” 

 
 

 



(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3217) 

CLAUSE 78 

THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting Clause 78 and substituting therefor the 

following new clause— 

Remuneration 
of members of 
the council of 

the Institute. 

78. The members of the Council of the Institute shall be paid 
such remuneration as the Salaries and Remuneration Commission 
shall determine. 

 
CLAUSE 79 

THAT, Clause 79 of the Bill be amended by deleting subclause (3) and substituting 

therefor the following new subclause— 

“(3)A person is qualified for appointment under subsection (1) if the person— 
(a) is a citizen of Kenya; 
(b) holds a Doctor of Philosophy or its equivalent in a relevant field from a 

university recognised in Kenya;  
(c) has at least ten years’ experience and knowledge in management;  
(d) has at least five years’ experience in a position of senior management; and 
(e) meets the requirements of Chapter Six of the Constitution.” 

 
CLAUSE 90 

THAT, Clause 90 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) by deleting the word 

“seven” appearing immediately after the words “a period of” and substituting 

therefor the word “three”. 
 

CLAUSE 93 

THAT, Clause 93 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1), by deleting the words “county executive committee member” 
and substituting therefor the words “respective county government”; and  

(b) in subclause (2), by deleting the words “county executive committee member” 
and substituting therefor the words “respective county government”. 
 

CLAUSE 94 

THAT, Clause 94 of the Bill be amended in subclause (2), by deleting the words 

“three months” and substituting therefor the words “six months” appearing in 

paragraph (b). 
 

CLAUSE 95 

THAT, Clause 95 of the Bill be amended in subclause (4)— 

(a) by deleting the words “thirty thousand” and substituting therefor the words 
“fifty thousand”; and  

(b) by deleting the words “two years” and substituting therefor the words “six 
months”. 

 



(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3218) 

CLAUSE 97 

THAT, Clause 97 of the Bill be amended by inserting the words “whichever is 

higher” immediately after the words “or coffee products or”. 
 

CLAUSE 99 

THAT, Clause 99 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) in subclause (1)— 
(i) by deleting the words “Council of County Governors” appearing in the 

opening statement and substituting therefore the words “licensing 
authorities”; and  

 

(ii) by deleting paragraph (a); 
(b) in subclause (2), by inserting the following new paragraphs immediately after 

paragraph (l)— 
“(m) qualifications for appointment and powers of inspectors; and 
(n) co-option of expert members to the Board.” 
 

CLAUSE 101 

THAT, Clause 101 of the Bill be amended—  

(a) by deleting the marginal note and substituting therefor the following new 

marginal note— 

“Assets and liabilities” 

(b) by renumbering the existing provision as subclause (1); 

(c) by inserting the following new subclause immediately after subclause (1)— 

“(2) All property, except such property as the Cabinet Secretary may specify 

in writing, which immediately before the commencement of this Act, was 

vested in the government for the use of the Coffee Directorate of the 

Agriculture and Food Authority, shall, on the date of commencement of 

this Act, vest in the Board subject to all interests, liabilities, charges, 

obligations and trusts affecting that property.” 

CLAUSE 104 

THAT, Clause 104 of the Bill be amended by deleting the word “Authority” 

appearing immediately after the words “made by the” and substituting therefor the 

word “Board.” 

CLAUSE 105 

THAT, Clause 105 of the Bill be amended by inserting the words “and shall undergo 

a skills audit to determine suitability” immediately after the words “Cabinet 

Secretary”. 

 



(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3219) 

SECOND SCHEDULE  

THAT, the Second Schedule to the Bill be amended by— 

(a) deleting in paragraphs 9 and substituting therefor the following new paragraph— 

No. Type of Licence/ 
Permit or Certificate  

Issuing Authority 

9. Warehouse licence Board in consultation with the county 
government  

  
(b) deleting paragraph 10 and substituting therefor the following new paragraph— 

No. Type of Licence/ Permit or 
Certificate  

Issuing Authority 

10. Coffee nursery certificates Board in consultation with the 
county government  

(c) by deleting paragraph 11 and substituting therefor the following new 
paragraph— 
 

No. Type of Licence/ Permit 
or Certificate  

Issuing Authority 

11. Pulping station licence Board in consultation with the county 
government  

 

(d) by deleting paragraph 13 and substituting therefor the following new 
paragraph— 

No. Type of Licence/ Permit 
or Certificate  

Issuing Authority 

13. Pulping station licence County government in consultation 
with the Board  

 

(e) by insert the following new paragraphs immediately after paragraph17— 
 

No. Type of Licence/ Permit 
or Certificate  

Issuing Authority 

18. Coffee Marketing Agents 
License 

Capital Markets Authority 

19. Trading License” Capital Markets Authority 

2) Notice is given that the Member for Funyula (Hon. Ojiambo Oundo) intends 
to move the following amendments to the Coffee Bill, 2023 at the Committee 
Stage— 

CLAUSE 8 

THAT, Clause 8(1) of the Bill be amended in paragraph (b) by deleting the words 

“secondary school education” appearing in subparagraph (ii) and substituting 

therefor the words “post-secondary school education”. 



(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3220) 

CLAUSE 11 

THAT, Clause 11 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) by deleting the words “the 
Kenya Bureau of Standards” appearing in paragraph (j) and substituting therefor the 
words “a body mandated by a national legislation to set standards”. 

 
CLAUSE 25 

THAT, Clause 25 of the Bill be amended in subclause (3) by deleting the words 
“county executive committee member” and substituting therefor the words 
“licensing authority”. 

 
CLAUSE 32 

THAT, Clause 32 of the Bill be amended by deleting the word “monthly” and 
substituting therefor the word “quarterly”. 

 
CLAUSE 50 

THAT, Clause 50 of the Bill be amended in subclause (6) by deleting the word 
“monthly” and substituting therefor the word “quarterly”. 

 
CLAUSE 72 

THAT, the Bill be amended in Clause 72 by inserting the following new subclause 
immediately after subclause (3)— 

“(4)A person is qualified for appointment under section (1)(e) and (f) if that 
person holds a post-secondary education certificate. 

 

3) Notice is given that the Member for Gichugu (Hon. Robert Gichimu) intends 
to move the following amendments to the Coffee Bill, 2023 at the Committee 
Stage— 

 

CLAUSE 2 

THAT, Clause 2 of the Bill be amended by deleting the definition of “buyer” and 
substituting therefor the following new definition— 

“buyer means a person or entity licensed by the Board to buy clean coffee at 
an exchange from a cooperative society, registered grower, coffee union, 
grower-miller or coffee estate for export, local sale, value addition or import 
clean coffee for secondary processing in Kenya”; 

 
 
 
 



(No. 108)       TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3221) 

 
CLAUSE 8 
THAT, Clause 8 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) by inserting the following 
new paragraph immediately after paragraph (c)— 

“(ca) the requirement of subsection (1)(b) shall not apply to member appointed 
under subsection 7(e) and (f)”. 

 

 

 
 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

........../Notices*(Cont’d) 



(No. 108)            TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3222) 

LIMITATION OF DEBATE 

The House resolved on Wednesday, February 14, 2024 as follows— 
 

Limitation of Debate on Motions 

III. THAT, each speech in a debate on any Motion, including a Special motion be 
limited in the following manner: A maximum of three hours with not more than 
twenty (20) minutes for the Mover and ten (10) minutes for each other Member 
speaking, except the Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the Minority 
Party, who shall be limited to a maximum of fifteen (15) minutes each, and that ten 
(10) minutes before the expiry of the time, the Mover be called upon to reply; and 
that priority in speaking be accorded to the Leader of the Majority Party, the Leader 
of the Minority Party and the Chairperson of the relevant Departmental Committee, 
in that order. 
 

Limitation of Debate on the Address by the President 

IV. THAT, debate on a Motion on the Address by H.E. the President under Article 
132(1) of the Constitution be limited as follows: A maximum of thirty (30) minutes 
for the Mover in moving, twenty (20) minutes for the Leader of the Minority Party, 
and ten (10) minutes each to the Chairperson of the Departmental Committee on 
Justice & Legal Affairs to speak on the report submitted under Article 132(1)(c)(i) of 
the Constitution relating to the realisation of national values; the Chairperson of the 
Departmental Committee on Defence, Intelligence & Foreign Relations to speak on 
the report submitted under Article 132(1)(c)(iii) of the Constitution relating to the 
progress made in fulfilling the international obligations of the Republic; and the Chairperson of 
the Departmental Committee on Administration & Internal Security to speak on the 
report submitted under Article 240(7) of the Constitution relating to the state of the 
security of the Country; and five (5) minutes for any other Member speaking, and that 
ten (10) minutes before the expiry of the time, the Mover be called upon to reply. 
 
Limitation of Debate on Individual Members’ Bills 

V. THAT, each speech in a debate on Bills NOT sponsored by a Committee, the 
Leader of the Majority Party or the Leader of the Minority Party shall be limited 
as follows: A maximum of three hours and thirty minutes, with not more than thirty 
(30) minutes for the Mover, in moving and ten (10) minutes in replying, a maximum 
of thirty (30) minutes for the Chairperson of the relevant Committee and a maximum 
of ten (10) minutes for any other Member speaking, except the Leader of the Majority 
Party and the Leader of the Minority Party, who shall be limited to a maximum of  
fifteen minutes (15) each; and that priority in speaking shall be accorded to the Leader 
of the Majority Party, the Leader of the Minority Party and the Chairperson of the 
relevant Departmental Committee, in that order. 
 



(No. 108)            TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 26, 2024                     (3223) 

Limitation of Debate on Bills sponsored by Parties or Committees 

VI. THAT, each speech in a debate on Bills sponsored by a Committee, the Leader 
of the Majority Party or the Leader of the Minority Party be limited as follows: 
A maximum of forty five (45) minutes for the Mover, in moving and fifteen minutes 
(15) in replying, a maximum of thirty (30) minutes for the Chairperson of the relevant 
Committee (if the Bill is not sponsored by the relevant Committee), and a maximum 
of ten (10) minutes for any other Member speaking, except the Leader of the Majority 

Party and the Leader of the Minority Party, who shall be limited to a maximum of 
fifteen minutes (15) each (if the Bill is not sponsored by either of them); and that 
priority in speaking shall be accorded to the Leader of the Majority Party, the Leader 
of the Minority Party and the Chairperson of the relevant Departmental Committee, 
in that order. 
 
 

Limitation of Debate on Other Committee Reports 

VII. THAT, each speech in a debate on Other Committee Reports, including a Report 
of a Joint Committee of the Houses of Parliament or any other Report submitted to 
the House for which limitation of time has not been specified, shall be limited as 
follows:- A maximum of two and a half hours, with not more than twenty (20) 
minutes for the Mover in moving and five (5) minutes for any other Member 
speaking, including the Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the Minority 
Party and the Chairperson of the relevant Committee (if the Committee Report is 
not moved by the Chairperson of the relevant Committee), and that ten (10) minutes 
before the expiry of the time, the Mover be called upon to reply; and further that 
priority in speaking shall be accorded to the Leader of the Majority Party and the 
Leader of the Minority Party, in that order. 
 

Limitation of Debate on Audit Committee Reports 

VIII. THAT, each speech in debate on Reports of Audit Committees be limited as 
follows: A maximum of sixty (60) minutes for the Mover in moving and thirty (30) 
minutes in replying, and a maximum of ten (10) minutes for any other Member 
speaking, except the Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the Minority 
Party, who shall be limited to a maximum of fifteen (15) minutes each; and that 
priority be accorded to the Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the 
Minority Party, in that order. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

……......./Notice Paper I* 



NOTICE PAPER I 

Tentative business for  
 

 

 

Wednesday (Morning), November 27, 2024 

(Published pursuant to Standing Order 38(1)) 
 

It is notified that the following business is tentatively scheduled to appear in the Order 
Paper for Wednesday (Morning), November 27, 2024 –  
 

A. PROCEDURAL MOTION – EXEMPTION OF BUSINESS FROM 
THE PROVISIONS OF STANDING 
ORDER 40(3) 

 (The Leader of the Majority Party) 

 
B. THE ENVIRONMENTAL MANAGEMENT AND COORDINATION 

(AMENDMENT) BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 66 OF 2023) 
(The Hon. Irene Mayaka, M.P.)  

Second Reading 
 

(Question to be put) 

 

C. MOTION: 006/2024 – COMPREHENSIVE REFORM OF 
EDUCATION BURSARY SCHEMES TO 
ENSURE FREE BASIC EDUCATION 
(The Hon. Esther Passaris, M.P.) 
 

(Question to be put) 

 

D. SPECIAL MOTION – CONSIDERATION OF NOMINEES FOR 
APPOINTMENT TO THE INDEPENDENT 
POLICING OVERSIGHT AUTHORITY 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on 
Administration and Internal Security) 
 

E. SPECIAL MOTION – CONSIDERATION OF NOMINEES FOR 
APPOINTMENT TO THE COMMISSION ON 
ADMINISTRATIVE JUSTICE 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Justice 
and Legal Affairs) 
 

F. SPECIAL MOTION – CONSIDERATION OF NOMINEES FOR 
APPOINTMENT TO THE SALARIES AND 
REMUNERATION COMMISSION 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on 
Labour) 
 



G. COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE HOUSE 
 

The Assisted Reproductive Technology Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 61 
of 2022) 
(The Hon. Millie Odhiambo Mabona, M.P.) 

 
H. THE CROPS (AMENDMENT) BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL 

NO. 8 OF 2023) 

(The Hon. Tandaza Sawa, M.P.) 
 

        Second Reading 

 
I. THE INSTITUTE OF SOCIAL WORK PROFESSIONALS BILL 

(NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 17 OF 2023) 
(The Hon. Joshua Kimilu, M.P.) 
 

      Second Reading  
 
 

J. THE GOLD PROCESSING BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 46 
OF 2023) 
(The Hon. Bernard Shinali, M.P.) 
           

           Second Reading 
 

K. MOTION: 033/2023 – SUPPORTING AND PROMOTING LOCAL 
FERTILIZER MANUFACTURING 
INDUSTRIES 

           (The Hon. Samuel Atandi, M.P.) 

 
L. MOTION: 026/2023 – NATIONAL SENSITIZATION AND SUPPORT 

FOR COMBATING SICKLE CELL AND 
HAEMOPHILIA DISEASES 
(The Hon. Peter Nabulindo, M.P.) 

 
M. MOTION: 031/2023 – PROVISION OF APPROPRIATE ACCESS TO 

MARKETS IN THE COUNTRY 
(The Hon. Beatrice Kemei, M.P.) 

 
N. MOTION: 035/2023 – GOVERNMENT-TO-GOVERNMENT (G2G) 

MODEL FOR ACQUISITION AND SUPPLY 
OF FERTILIZERS TO FARMERS AT 
SUBSIDIZED COST  
(The Hon. Geoffrey Ruku, M.P.) 

 



O. MOTION: 038/2023 – DEVELOPMENT OF MEASURES TO 
MITIGATE DIGITAL EXCLUSION 
(The Hon. Marianne Kitany, M.P.) 

 
P. MOTION: 040/2023 – ESTABLISHMENT OF A NATIONAL POLICY 

TO COMBAT DISRESPECTFUL 
CHILDBIRTH PRACTICES IN KENYA  
(The Hon. Gathoni Wamuchomba, M.P.) 

 
Q. MOTION: 044/2023 – FORMULATION OF A LAND USE POLICY 

ON ZONING OF LAND FOR AGRICULTURE 
AND BUILT DEVELOPMENT 
(The Hon. Timothy Wanyonyi, M.P.) 

 
R. MOTION: 039/2023 – FORMULATION OF A REGULATORY 

FRAMEWORK ON ARTIFICIAL 
INTELLIGENCE IN THE COUNTRY 
(The Hon. Marianne Kitany, M.P.) 

 
S. MOTION: 045/2023 – REVIEW OF THE ELIGIBILITY AGE FOR 

ENROLMENT OF OLDER MEMBERS OF 

SOCIETY TO THE INUA JAMII CASH 
TRANSFER PROGRAMME 

          (The Hon. Majimbo Kalasinga, M.P.) 

 
T. MOTION: 001/2024 – FORMULATION OF A REWARD SCHEME 

FOR ACCOMPLISHMENTS BY 
SPORTSPERSONS IN INTERNATIONAL 
COMPETITIONS 

           (The Hon. Charles Ngusya, M.P.) 

 
U. MOTION: 002/2024 – EXPANSION OF MAJOR ROADS IN THE 

COUNTRY TO DUAL CARRIAGEWAYS 
           (The Hon. Faith Gitau, M.P.) 

 
V. HOJA: 003/2024 – UUNDAJI WA SERA ZA KUSHUGHULIKIA 

MATUKIO YA UBAGUZI DHIDI YA 
WANAFUNZI WA DINI MBALIMBALI 
KATIKA TAASISI ZA ELIMU NCHINI 
(Mhe. Mohamed Ali, M.P.) 

 
 



W. MOTION: 005/2024 – INTRODUCTION OF MANDATORY 
COMMUNITY SERVICE TO ALL LEARNERS 
UPON COMPLETION OF SECONDARY 
SCHOOL EDUCATION 
(The Hon. Amos Mwago, M.P.) 
 
 

X. THE PARLIAMENTARY POWERS AND PRIVILEGES 
(AMENDMENT) BILL (SENATE BILL NO. 37 OF 2023) 
(The Hon. Jack Wamboka, M.P. – Co-Sponsor) 
          

           Second Reading 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

……......./Notice Paper II* 



NOTICE PAPER II 
 

Tentative business for  
 

Wednesday (Afternoon), November 27, 2024 

(Published pursuant to Standing Order 38(1)) 

It is notified that the following business is tentatively scheduled to appear in the Order 
Paper for Wednesday (Afternoon), November 27, 2024 – 
 
A. THE UNCLAIMED FINANCIAL ASSETS (AMENDMENT) BILL 

(NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 15 OF 2024) 

  (The Leader of the Majority Party) 
 

     Second Reading 
 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 
B. THE PUBLIC FINANCE MANAGEMENT (AMENDMENT) (No. 3) 

BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 44 OF 2024) 

  (The Leader of the Majority Party) 
 

     Second Reading 
 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 
C. THE PUBLIC FINANCE MANAGEMENT (AMENDMENT) (No. 4) 

BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 45 OF 2024) 

  (The Leader of the Majority Party) 
 

     Second Reading 
 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 
D. THE PUBLIC PROCUREMENT AND ASSET DISPOSAL 

(AMENDMENT) BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 48 OF 2024) 

  (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Finance and National Planning) 
 

     Second Reading 
 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 

 

E. SPECIAL MOTION – CONSIDERATION OF NOMINEES FOR 
APPOINTMENT TO THE NATIONAL 
GENDER AND EQUALITY COMMISSION 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Social 
Protection) 
 
 



F. SPECIAL MOTION – CONSIDERATION OF A NOMINEE FOR 
APPOINTMENT AS THE DEPUTY 
GOVERNOR OF THE CENTRAL BANK OF 
KENYA 
(The Co-Chairperson, Joint Parliamentary Committee 
on vetting of a nominee for appointment as the 
Deputy Governor of the Central Bank of Kenya) 
 

G. COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE HOUSE 
 

(i) The Ethics and Anti-Corruption Commission (Amendment) Bill (National 
Assembly Bill No. 11 of 2024) 
(The Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the Minority Party) 

(ii) The Kenya Roads Board (Amendment) Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 18 of 
2024) 
(The Leader of the Majority Party) 

(iii) The Kenya Revenue Authority (Amendment) (No. 2) Bill (National Assembly 
Bill No. 35 of 2024) 
(The Leader of the Majority Party) 

 
H. THE LAND CONTROL BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 39 

OF 2023) 
(The Hon. (Dr.) Wilberforce Oundo, M.P.)  

Second Reading 
 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 
I. THE HIGHER EDUCATION LOANS BOARD (AMENDMENT) BILL 

(NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 58 OF 2022) 
(The Hon. Joyce Kamene, M.P.) 

Second Reading 
 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

   

J. MOTION –  CONSIDERATION OF REPORTS ON FINANCIAL 
STATEMENTS OF STATE CORPORATIONS (NYANZA 
REGION) 

  (The Chairperson, Public Investments Committee on Governance      

and Education) 
 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 

K. THE POLITICAL PARTIES (AMENDMENT) BILL (NATIONAL 
ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 35 OF 2022) 
(The Vice Chairperson, Procedure and House Rules Committee) 

 

 

Second Reading 
 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 



 

L. THE PUBLIC FINANCE MANAGEMENT (AMENDMENT) BILL 
(NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 38 OF 2022) 
(The Vice Chairperson, Procedure and House Rules Committee) 

 

 

Second Reading 
 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 

 

M. THE EQUALISATION FUND (ADMINISTRATION) BILL (SENATE 
BILL NO. 14 OF 2023) 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Finance and National Planning) 

Second Reading 
 
 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

N. MOTION –  ALLEGED UNFAIR TRADE PRACTICES BY FOREIGN 
INVESTORS IN KENYA 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Trade, Industry 
and Cooperatives) 

 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 
 

 
O. MOTION – THIRD REPORT ON CONSIDERATION OF THE 

AUDITED ACCOUNTS OF SPECIFIED STATE 
CORPORATIONS 
(The Chairperson, Public Investments Committee on Social 
Services, Administration and Agriculture) 
 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 

P. THE UNIVERSITIES (AMENDMENT) BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY 
BILL NO. 38 OF 2023) 

(The Chairperson, Public Investments Committee on Governance and Education) 

Second Reading 
 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 
Q. MOTION –  REPORT OF THE EXTRAORDINARY SESSION OF 

THE SIXTH PAN-AFRICAN PARLIAMENT (PAP) 
(Member of the Pan-African Parliament) 
 
(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 



R. MOTION -   REPORT ON THE PERFORMANCE AUDIT REPORT 
ON THE PROVISION OF SERVICES TO PERSONS 
WITH DISABILITIES BY THE NATIONAL COUNCIL 
FOR PERSONS WITH DISABILITIES 
(The Chairperson, Public Investments Committee on Social 
Services, Administration and Agriculture) 
 
(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 
 

S. THE NATIONAL POLICE SERVICE COMMISSION (AMENDMENT) 
BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 23 OF 2024) 

(The Hon. Peter Masara, M.P.) 

Second Reading 
 

(If not concluded on Tuesday, November 26, 2024 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

........../Appendix* 



APPENDIX 

NOTICE OF PETITIONS, QUESTIONS & 

STATEMENTS 
 

ORDER NO. 7 - STATEMENTS 

It is notified that, pursuant to the provisions of Standing Order 44(2)(c), the 

following Statements will be requested— 

 

No. Subject   Member Relevant Committee 

1.  Security situation in Chesegon 
area, located on the border 
between Elgeyo-Marakwet 
and West Pokot Counties 
 
 

Hon. Rael Kasiwai, MP 
(West Pokot County)  
 

Administration and 
Internal Security 

2.  Status on implementation of 
Makamini Dam Project 

Hon. Gonzi Rai, MP 
(Kinango)  

 

Blue Economy, 
Water and Irrigation 

3.  Criteria for recognition and 
equation of certificates and 
diplomas obtained from 
schools offering international 
curricula 
 
 

Hon. Rashid Bedzimba, MP 
(Kisauni)  
 

Education 

 

 

 


